

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
**P. O. BOX 2449**  
**SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449**  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL Purchase and Installation of Two (2) Pleated Polypropylene  
 FOR: Filters for SAWS Brackish Groundwater Production Wells  
 TIME &  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 11, 2017  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

The EADS Co.  
 606 Savage Lane  
 Corpus Christi, TX 78408

The EADS Co.  
 606 Savage Lane  
 Corpus Christi, TX 78408

Mueller Water Conditioning,  
 Inc.  
 1500 Sherwood Forest Street  
 Houston, TX 77043

Andon

<b>OPTION 1</b>	2 ea. Pleated Polypropylene Filters Vessels, Mfg. Fil-Trek Corporation, Model No. S6UFH22-07-40-8F-150, Mfg Parker Hannifin Corporation Model No. PXSU0540H08F or equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL				
1.			NO BID	30,485.00 60,970.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Mfg Quoting: Part No. Quoting:	MFG PART		Parker PXSU0540H08FB		
	7 ea. Pleated Polypropylene Filters, Mfg. Fil-Trek Corporation (Model No. UF-5-40-BN) Mfg Parker Hannifin Corporation (Model No. RCP-045-40-N-PP) or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL				
2.			NO BID	312.00 2,184.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Make/Model	MFG PART		Parker RCP-045-40-N-PP		
	<b>TOTAL</b>	TOTAL	NO BID	63,154.00	NO BID	NO BID
<b>OPTION 2</b>	2 ea. Pleated Polypropylene Filters Vessels, Mfg. Fil-Trek Corporation, Model No. S6UFH22-07-40-8F-150, Mfg Parker Hannifin Corporation Model No. PXSU0540H08F or equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL				
1.			16,086.00 32,172.00	24,342.00 48,684.00	30,749.09 61,498.18	NO BID
	Mfg Quoting: Part No. Quoting:	MFG PART	Fil-Trek S6UFH22-07-40-8F10F-150		Parker Hannifin PXSU0540H08F	
	7 ea. Pleated Polypropylene Filters, Mfg. Fil-Trek Corporation (Model No. UF-5-40-BN) Mfg Parker Hannifin Corporation (Model No. RCP-045-40-N-PP) or approved equal	UNIT PRICE TOTAL				
2.			208.00 1,456.00	312.00 2,184.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Make/Model	MFG PART	Fil-Trek UF-5-40-BN			
			*			
	<b>TOTAL</b>	TOTAL	<b>33,628.00</b>	50,868.00	61,498.18	NO BID
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR: Purchase and Installation of Two (2) Pleated Polypropoylene Filters for SAWS Brackish Groundwater Production Wells  
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 11, 2017  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			The EADS Co. 606 Savage Lane Corpus Christi, TX 78408	The EADS Co. 606 Savage Lane Corpus Christi, TX 78408	Mueller Water Conditioning, Inc. 1500 Sherwood Forest Street Houston, TX 77043	Andon
	Delivery Days		7 weeks	80 days	50 days	

**\*LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Andon  
 Baytech Supply  
 EADS Co.  
 Fil-Trek  
 Lone Star International  
 Mueller  
 Taylor Made Hose

Demandstar  
 SAWS Website